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MONROE PUBLIC SCHOOLS BOARD OF EDUCATION 
Board Meeting #9 

Tuesday, May 20, 2014 
7:00 p.m. 

 
6:30 p.m. – SCHOLARSHIP RECIPIENT RECEPTION 

 
 

AGENDA 
             Page 
 

A. Roll Call and Call to Order      Mr. Yeo  1  
1. Pledge of Allegiance to the Flag     Mr. Yeo 
2. Waterloo School – Bridgestone Grant Winner   Mrs. Everly 

       
B. Public Commentary – Agenda Items Only    Mr. Yeo 

 
C. Discussion and Action Items 

1. Approval of Minutes      Mr. Yeo  2 
Move to approve the minutes of the following meetings as 
submitted: 
• May 6, 2014 Board Meeting #8  
• May 8, 2014 Special Board Meeting 
• May 8, 2014 Closed Meeting 
• May 15, 2014 Special Board Meeting 
• May 15, 2014 Closed Meeting 

 
2. Reports and Updates      Mr. Yeo  8 

a. May 5, 2014 Board Personnel Committee Meeting Minutes 
 

3. Exempt Administrative Contract    Dr. McLeod  12 
Move to approve administrative contract for Dr. Barry  
Martin as recommended for the 2014-2015 through  
2016-2017 school years. 
 

4. Exempt Administrative Contract Extension   Dr. Martin  13 
Move to approve administrative contract extension for  
Julie Everly and Ryan McLeod as recommended for the  
2015/16 school year. 

 
5. Exempt Administrative Contract Extension   Dr. McLeod  14 

Move to approve administrative contract extension for  
Katherine Eighmey, Jerry Oley, and David Payne as  
recommended for the 2014/15 school year. 
 
 



6. Administrative Contract Extensions    Dr. McLeod  15 
Move to approve administrative contract extensions for:  
Montyne Barbee, Jennifer Bennett, Shelley Cormier,  
Matthew Cortez, Mary Ann Cyr, Kim Diven, William  
Ferrara, Cindy Flynn, Teresa Joseph, Lisa McLaughlin,  
Kelly McMahon, Steve Pollzzie, Melissa Provo, John Ray,  
and Otto Zillgitt as recommended for the 2014/15 school year. 

 
7. Resolution to Support the MCISD Proposed Budget  

for 2014/15       Mrs. Eighmey  16 
Move to approve the ISD Budget Resolution as presented. 

 
8. Section 105 and 105C Opt-out Resolution   Dr. Martin  22 

Move to approve Section 105 and 105C Opt-out Resolution  
as presented. 

 
9. Emergency Roof Repair at MMS    Mr. Oley  25 

Move to accept the bid from Nordman Roofing Co.,  
Inc. from Adrian, Michigan, for $12,474.00 for 
emergency repair to the Monroe Middle School roof.   
Money for this project will come from the Site  
Sinking Fund. 
  

10. First Vehicle Contract Extension    Mr. Oley  28 
Move to accept the proposed one year contract extension  
from First Vehicle Services for the 2014/2015 school year  
by adjusting the current contract price using Consumer  
Price Index (CPI). 
 

11. Carpet/Tile Repair and Replacement    Mr. Oley  31  
Move to accept the bid of $36,819.00 from Runyon’s  
Home Decorating of Monroe, Michigan, to repair and/or  
replace carpet throughout the district.  Money for this  
purchase will come from the Site Sinking Budget.    
 

12. Varsity Track and Field State Finals    Dr. McLeod  65  
Move to approve the attendance of Monroe High School  
students at the MHSAA Varsity Track and Field State  
Meet in Rockford, Michigan, according to the terms  
of Policy IICA, Field Trips and Excursions. 

 
13. Superintendent’s Comments     Dr. Martin 

 
14. Old Business       Mr. Yeo 

 
15. New Business       Mr. Yeo 



 
16. Public Commentary – Any Topic    Mr. Yeo 

 
17. Adjournment       Mr. Yeo  71 

Move that the May 20, 2014 Board Meeting #9 of the  
Monroe Public Schools Board of Education be adjourned. 

 



   Board Meeting #9 
         May 20, 2014 
         Item A 
  
 
 
 

ROLL CALL 
 
 
 
       Present  Absent 
 
   
  Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor  ______ ______ 
 
  Dr. March    ______ ______ 
 
  Mr. Mason    ______ ______ 
 
  Mr. Philbeck    ______ ______ 
 
  Ms. Spicer    ______ ______ 
 
  Mr. VanWasshenova   ______ ______ 
 
  Mr. Yeo    ______ ______ 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.1 
 

 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES 

 
 
ENCLOSURES 

• May 6, 2014 Board Meeting #8 Minutes 
• May 8, 2014 Special Board Meeting Minutes 
• May 15, 2014 Special Board Meeting Minutes 

 
 
RECOMMENDATION      
Move to approve the following minutes as submitted:    

• May 6, 2014 Board Meeting #8 
• May 8, 2014 Special Board Meeting 
• May 8, 2014 Closed Meeting 
• May 15, 2014 Special Board Meeting 
• May 15, 2014 Closed Meeting 

 
 
  
 
MOTION: _______________   SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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MONROE PUBLIC SCHOOLS BOARD OF EDUCATION 

Board Meeting #8 
May 6, 2014 

6:00 p.m. 
 

MINUTES 
 
Roll Call and Call to Order 
Board Members Present: President Robert Yeo, Trustee Aaron N. Mason, Trustee Ryan Philbeck, and 

Trustee Wendy Spicer 
 
Board Members Absent: Vice President Lawrence VanWasshenova, Secretary June Knabusch-

Taylor, Parliamentarian Dr. Tedd March 
 
Administrators Present: Barry Martin, Julie Everly, Ryan McLeod, Jerry Oley 
 
Administrators Absent: Katherine Eighmey, David Payne 
 
President Yeo called the meeting to order at 6:09 p.m. 
 
Public Commentary-Agenda Items Only 
There was none at this time. 
 
Approval of Minutes 
Motion by Mr. Mason; support by Mr. Philbeck to approve the minutes of the following meetings as 
submitted: 

• April 15, 2014 Board Work Session  
• April 15, 2014 Board Meeting #7  
• April 17, 2014 Special Board Meeting (2 sets) 
• April 30, 2014 Special Board Meeting  

Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 roll call vote. 
 
Reports and Update 
The April 14, 2014 Board Curriculum Committee Minutes were received without comment. 
 
Board Policies – Final Reading 
Motion by Mr. Mason; support by Ms. Spicer to adopt Board Policies (Section 5000 – Personnel) as 
written effective May 6, 2014. 
Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 roll call vote. 
 
National Student Leadership Conference 
Motion by Mr. Philbeck; support by Mr. Mason to approve the request for a Monroe High School Upward 
Bound student to attend the National Student Leadership Conference in Washington D.C. according to the 
terms of Policy IICA, Field Trips and Excursions. 
Discussion:  Anthony Quinn, Director of the Upward Bound program, and the student who will attend the 
conference were present this evening.    
Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 roll call vote. 
 
Fire Alarm Upgrades at Arborwood South 
Motion by Mr. Philbeck; support by Mr. Mason to accept the low bid of $85,900.00 from Geal Electric of 
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Board Meeting #8 May 6, 2014 Page 2 
 
 

 

Monroe, Michigan, for the fire alarm upgrades at Arborwood South.  This project includes removing the 
old, outdated fire alarm system and the equipment that no longer has replacement parts.  Money for this 
project will come from the Site Sinking Fund. 
Discussion:  There will be a significant balance in the Site Sinking Fund even after these projects are 
complete.  These upgrades address safety issues as well as cost saving measures.   
Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 roll call vote. 
 
Masonry Repairs at Monroe High School 
Motion by Mr. Mason; support by Mr. Philbeck to accept the low bid of $116,540.00 from Grunwell-
Cashero of Toledo, Ohio, for the masonry repairs at Monroe High School.  Money for this project will 
come from the Site Sinking Fund. 
Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 roll call vote. 
 
Parking Lot Re-Construction at Monroe High School 
Motion by Mr. Philbeck; support by Mr. Mason to accept the low bid of $621,500.00 from Best Asphalt 
of Romulus, Michigan, for the re-construction of the parking lot at Monroe High School.  Additional 
parking lot re-construction is needed in A-wing to C-wing installing nine additional catch basins, and 
adding an additional 131 parking spaces combined.  Money for this project will come from the Site 
Sinking Fund. 
Discussion:  There will be one more phase after this portion is complete.  The staff lot needs to be 
redesigned to use the space more efficiently.  
Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 roll call vote. 
 
Superintendent Comments   

• Monroe High School held its first-ever Decision Day last Thursday when more than 400 members 
of the Class of 2014 declared their future intentions for universities, colleges, community colleges, 
trade schools or the military service.  Nearly 90 percent of the kids have developed a post-
secondary plan. Matt Gertz, our keynote speaker and former valedictorian, had a wonderful 
message for the students.  The event was video streamed live on YouTube.  Prior to the Decision 
Day event, more than a dozen employers participated in a job fair.  Several students had interviews 
and some were hired on the spot.   

• Waterloo School received nearly 400,000 votes in the Waterloo-Bridgestone grant contest which 
ended April 30.  Congratulations and thanks to the Waterloo Staff, especially Principal Lisa 
McLaughlin, and the Waterloo PTO who worked tirelessly to get people to vote.  We expect to be 
notified by the end of the month if Waterloo was successful. 

• Several Monroe Public Schools and ISD staff will be honored next week by the Council for 
Exceptional Children for their work during the 2013/14 school year.  Congratulations to 
Arborwood Principal Steve Pollzzie, Administrator of the Year; Shelley Cormier and Tim Vinton 
from our Transportation Department, Non-certified Service Persons of the Year; Lauren Rhoades, 
ISD teacher at Monroe High School, Special Education Teacher of the year, and the ISD’s 
Kathleen Pete of MHS, Special Education Paraprofessional of the Year.   

• The Lake Erie Awareness Partnership of Monroe Public Schools and the Monroe Boat Club will 
host a two-day Boater’s Safety Certification Program on May 17 and 18 at the Monroe Boat Club 
and the Knabusch Math and Science Center.  This workshop is aimed at beginning boaters to give 
them the knowledge needed to obtain a boat license or safety certification in many states.  It 
includes an introduction to boating, safety equipment, navigation, maintenance, and emergency 
action.   
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• Kelsey Starr from Starr Insurance will present a check to Custer School for the purchase of 
physical education equipment. 

• Monroe High School’s student council will be honored at the Monroe Rotary Service Above Self 
Awards dinner this Thursday at MCCC.  Shaela Owens, Andrew Notario, Jonathan Voelker and 
C.J. Frank will attend the dinner representing the student council. 

• MHS freshman GiGi Pancone sang the National Anthem at the Toledo Mud Hens game last week. 
• Monroe High School’s Senior Awards Night will be at 7:00 p.m. on Wednesday, May 14.  

Monroe Middle School’s Celebration and Awards Night is set for May 27.  The Monroe High 
School Jazz Band will perform on May 22 at 7:00 p.m. at St. Mary’s Park to kick off the popular 
Summer Entertainment in the Park series. 

• The Monroe High School baseball team won a doubleheader most recently against Adrian and 
now has a record of seventeen wins, one loss and one tie, and has won all eight of its SEC games. 

• Our elementary girls on the run program has been very successful.  Waterloo and Manor girls will 
get together this Thursday for a mock 5K run.   

• School will dismiss one hour early tomorrow. 
 
Mr. Yeo requested a moment of silence in remembrance of the four students we recently lost.  
 
Old Business  
Mr. Mason mentioned the college classes that are being offered at Monroe High School holds great 
promise for the future.  The Monroe County Middle College recently held their graduation and a number 
of students received their associate’s degree along with a high school diploma.  With college classes at the 
high school, we are now able to offer students the same opportunity on the MHS campus.    
 
New Business   
There was no none at this time. 
 
Public Commentary-Any Topic  
Selma Rankins shared an article with Board members.  Mr. Rankins complimented a couple of citizens 
who were helping students learn math at Navarre Branch Library.    
 
Athletic Director John Ray stated that he has received many positive comments from outsiders in regards 
to how well our facilities are maintained.   
 
Mr. Philbeck thinks Monroe Public Schools is an exceptional institution.     
 
Adjournment  
Motion by Mr. Mason; support by Mr. Philbeck that the May 6, 2014, Board Meeting #8 of the Monroe 
Public Schools Board of Education be adjourned.   
Vote:  Motion carried by a 4-0 hand vote at 6:43 p.m. 
 

 
 
 

_________________________________________________ 
June Knabusch-Taylor, Secretary 
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MONROE BOARD OF EDUCATION 

1275 North Macomb Street, Monroe, Michigan 48162 
Special Board Meeting, Thursday, May 8, 2014 

5:30 p.m. 
 

MINUTES 

Roll Call and Call to Order 
Board Members Present: President Robert Yeo, Vice President Lawrence VanWasshenova, 

Secretary June Knabusch-Taylor, Parliamentarian Tedd March, Trustee 
Aaron N. Mason, and Trustee Wendy Spicer 

 
Board Members Absent: Trustee Ryan Philbeck 
 
Others Present: Barry Martin, Ryan McLeod, James Davies, Otto Zillgitt, Sue Sacks, 

student (582014a), student’s mother and father 
 
Mr. Yeo called the meeting to order at 5:40 p.m. 
 
Closed Session 
Motion by Mr. Mason, support by Mr. VanWasshenova, to convene in closed session for the purpose of 
conducting a student disciplinary hearing.  Open Meeting Act; Section 8 (b). 
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 hand vote at 5:40 p.m. 
 
Reconvene Board Meeting 
Motion by Mr. VanWasshenova, support by Mr. Mason, that the closed session adjourn and the 5:30 
p.m., May 8, 2014, Special Board Meeting reconvene. 
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 hand vote at 6:10 p.m. 
 
Recommendation 
Motion by Mr. Mason, support by Mr. VanWasshenova, to suspend the student through June 17, 2014, 
based on the belief that the student did not knowingly possess the weapon and did not possess it as a 
weapon.  The student will be invited to attend summer school and return on the first day of the 2014/15 
school year.     
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 roll call vote at 6:22 p.m. 

Adjournment 
Motion by Mr. Mason, support by Dr. March, that the May 8, 2014, Special Board Meeting of the 
Monroe Public Schools Board of Education be adjourned. 
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 hand vote at 6.22 p.m. 
  
 
 
 
_______________________________________________ 
June Knabusch-Taylor, Secretary 
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MONROE BOARD OF EDUCATION 

1275 North Macomb Street, Monroe, Michigan 48162 
Special Board Meeting, Thursday, May 15, 2014 

5:00 p.m. 
 

MINUTES 

Roll Call and Call to Order 
Board Members Present: President Robert Yeo, Vice President Lawrence VanWasshenova, 

Secretary June Knabusch-Taylor (arrived at 5:11 p.m.), Parliamentarian 
Tedd March, Trustee Aaron N. Mason, and Trustee Wendy Spicer 

 
Board Members Absent: Trustee Ryan Philbeck 
 
Others Present: Barry Martin, Julie Everly, James Davies, Montyne Barbee, student 

(5152014a), and student’s mother 
 
Mr. Yeo called the meeting to order at 5:09 p.m. 
 
Closed Session 
Motion by Mr. VanWasshenova, support by Mr. Mason, to convene in closed session for the purpose of 
conducting a student disciplinary hearing.  Open Meeting Act; Section 8 (b). 
Vote: Motion carried by a 5-0 hand vote at 5:09 p.m. 
 
Reconvene Board Meeting 
Motion by Mr. VanWasshenova, support by Mr. Mason, that the closed session adjourn and the 5:00 
p.m., March 15, 2014, Special Board Meeting reconvene. 
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 hand vote at 5:16 p.m. 
 
Recommendation 
Motion by Mr. VanWasshenova, support by Dr. March, for the student to return to school on Friday, 
May 16, 2014, based on the belief that the student did not knowingly possess the weapon.           . 
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 roll call vote at 5:18 p.m. 

Adjournment 
Motion by Mr. Mason, support by Dr. March, that the May 15, 2014, Special Board Meeting of the 
Monroe Public Schools Board of Education be adjourned. 
Vote: Motion carried by a 6-0 hand vote at 5:18 p.m. 
  
 
 
 
_______________________________________________ 
June Knabusch-Taylor, Secretary 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.2 
 
 
        
 
 

REPORTS AND UPDATES 
 
 
 
 
BOARD COMMITTEES/OTHER REPORTS 
 

•  May 5, 2014 Board Personnel Committee Meeting Minutes 
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Monroe Public Schools Board Personnel Committee Meeting Minutes 
Date of Meeting:  May 5, 2014 
Present: June Knabusch-Taylor, Aaron Mason and Robert Yeo 

Barry Martin, Julie Everly, Ryan McLeod and Holly Scherer  
 

Next Meeting:  June 2, 2014 
 
 
1. Call to Order: The meeting was called to order at 5:10 pm. 

 
2. Minutes: April meeting minutes previously approved  

 
3. Public Commentary:   None 
 
4. Staffing Updates    

 
Mrs. Scherer reported no new retirement announcements since last meeting.    We continue to have 
movement in the bus driver ranks with two new resignations.     Mrs. Everly reported that we are 
again going to be advertising to recruit bus drivers.    Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor asked how this 
advertising was done.    Mrs. Scherer noted that we currently advertise with Monroe Evening News, 
at Monroe County Community College on their job board, information is available on the Monroe 
Public School website and we send out notices on our Facebook page.     Administration continues to 
focus on ways to attract, recruit and maintain within that unit. 

 
5. Teacher Evaluation Demonstration:    

 
Dr. McLeod introduced Mrs. Provo, MMS Assistant Principal, who joined the group this evening to 
share a sample of the teacher evaluation process as the committee had previously requested.   She 
shared this process as an on-going conversation and a collaborative process between the 
administrator and teacher.  Discussions include goal identification in each of the four domains of 
planning and preparation, creating a culture/classroom environment, delivery of instruction, and 
professionalism.    The process includes a pre-evaluation conference, a self-evaluation tool, follow-
up conference summary, data reflections, feedback on walk through visits, a post-conference and 
culminating with the final evaluation.   Dr. Martin pointed out that a big turn-around in the last 
couple years is that we are talking about the data; all teachers are having conversations on data and 
the impact and reflections.  Mrs. Provo noted holding expectations to higher levels and the 
investment that administrators are having with the teachers are important pieces.    
 
Mrs. Everly noted that these four domains are areas that are being discussed as part of the district 
improvement plan, so all teachers are getting the same message district wide.    Dr. McLeod shared 
that efforts to tie professional development, to the classroom, to the evaluation process, and to 
ongoing school improvement means that all teachers are working  
on a district wide level toward the main goals of the district.    Dr. McLeod also noted one of the 
challenges over the past few years is developing a standard level of expectations that all 
administrators share.     On-going conversations are now happening that help and guide the 
administration team on standards of expectations for buildings, as well as conversations about 
consistency district-wide.     
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Aligning with the expectations, improvement plans are also part of this evaluation process for any 
teachers who are identified to be below effective.  Dr. McLeod pointed out that these improvement 
plans are put in place when struggles are first noted, before the final evaluation occurs, so that the 
supports can be identified to help the teacher to be successful.  These improvement plans may be 
informal or formal.  The informal plans work best with teachers who are open to receiving feedback 
and help.  Formal improvement plans are most often utilized when the informal conversations aren’t 
showing progress.  These formal plans outline expectations, give specific goals and identify 
timelines that are monitored.   
 
Mrs. Everly shared that it is not uncommon to see progressive discipline in addition to the 
improvement plan when progress is not being made.   Conversations with administrators involve the 
ideas of keeping consistency with building evidence and giving directives with firm guidelines.    
Talking about culture changes, the peer influences are also having input into moving forward as a 
whole.   Mrs. Everly did recognize that administration is seeing less of the low level discipline 
concerns that we’ve previously had, which we contribute to the culture shift.      
 
Mrs. Everly shared that the consistency of the process is something that the central office team is 
proud of, and their focus has been to find ways for administrators to get out of the office and into the 
classrooms; as well as opportunities for follow up conversations which are essential.   Dr. Martin 
noted problems previously with tools that were given but then fell flat when follow up didn’t 
happen.  This evaluation process ties nicely into promoting the district goals.   Mrs. Knabusch-
Taylor expressed her gratitude for this information and asked if the committee could have copies of 
the presentation.    Mrs. Provo agreed to forward a copy of her presentation.  
 
Mr. Yeo asked when this overall goal will begin to show factual results on success.    Mrs. Provo 
shared that things are happening now with rising expectations; she feels that the efforts are making 
an improvement.    Mr. Yeo does feel the synergy of where the group wants to go, and feels the 
Board has supported these efforts with new tools, but he would still like to see proof of results.  Dr. 
Martin acknowledged this request, noting he agrees that it is important for administration to see 
these improvements and he will look into ways of how to put that into a perspective for the Board.      

 
6. Summer Learning Academy:   

 
Mrs. Every reported that given the positive results that were shown last summer in the K-8 Summer 
Learning Academy; administration plans to expand that success this year to include K-12 students.    
This summer the Learning Academy program will be held at Monroe High School in A-wing with 
potential of some additional areas of overflow.    
 
We are currently in the staff recruiting stage and postings have gone out to staff today.   Positions 
will include two co-administrators, teachers, interventionists for small group, concentrated support, 
technology liaisons in grades 1-6 classes, classroom assistants in Y-5 and Kindergarten classrooms; 
and breakfast assistants.     At this point, with the exception of the administrator stipend, the costs for 
the program will be grant funded.    Dr. McLeod noted that MHS previously had a stipend for an 
administrator to oversee the summer school program there, and it is in the intent to use that stipend 
to fund the co-administrator positions. 
 
Summer school will run June 30th to August 7th (6 weeks).  The expectation will continue to be that 
administrators are in the classroom every day and providing instruction to teachers; Administrators 
will also monitor data of the higher needs students. 
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In addition to staffing, we are working to generate the lists of students who will be invited to the 
Summer Learning Academy.     There is potential of having 18-22 classrooms and hopes of having 
300 students enrolled.   The benefits of holding the program at MHS will be exposure to the building 
itself, but also the availability of air conditioning and the pool.  In addition to the AM program, the 
group is researching outreach pieces for afternoon opportunities.   Examples include sites where a 
group of teacher leaders can be available for small group instructions and ideas to use the Knabusch-
Math and Science Center.  It is anticipated that some 31A money may be available to support these 
outreach programs.            
 

7. Old Business: 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor asked if we had an idea of the number of students who started MHS in 9th 
grade and will now be graduating.  Dr. McLeod noted that information was not yet available as some 
seniors are finishing the final coursework now.     
 
Mr. Yeo asked if a graduation location had been determined.    Graduation will be held at MHS, but 
the decision for indoors or outdoors will be made based on the weather conditions on that day.    Dr. 
Martin shared that we are also looking to provide a video, similar to Decision Day to make the 
streaming of graduation available. 
 
Mr. Yeo commended the staff on the great job on Decision Day noting that it was exciting and very 
well received; and the you-tube video was a nice addition. Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor asked if there 
would be a way to track these students as they go on to colleges.   Dr. Martin noted that we do 
participate in the Student Tracker system at the State of Michigan and as long as the universities 
participate, we will be able to track that information.  
 

8. New Business:  
 
Dr. McLeod shared that new this year administrators are doing instructional rounds as groups.    Mrs. 
Everly explained that this is similar to medical rounds – the process takes about an hour to visit a 
building, and then time after the process to debrief.      Dr. McLeod and Mrs. Everly meet with the 
group to identify a question that ties what is happening at the building to how it relates to the District 
School Improvement.   The group then observes the classrooms with that question in mind, making 
observations and then meeting afterward to discuss what they saw.   After the debriefing, the 
principal of that building takes the feedback and crafts an email to the staff, which includes 
suggestions and questions for discussion at future staff meetings.   This has been powerful to help 
administrators know status of program, but also next steps to improve those.      Dr. Martin noted 
tremendous impact that Dr. McLeod and Mrs. Everly are having as they lead by example and are 
engaged makes a big difference. 

 
9. Future Agenda Items:     None noted 
 
10. Next Meeting:    June 2, 2014 at 5:00 PM       
 
11. Adjournment:  The meeting was adjourned at 7:05 PM 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.3 
 
 

EXEMPT ADMINISTRATIVE CONTRACT  
 
 
BACKGROUND 
In order to provide notice of contract status, we are recommending that the board authorize 
administration to issue contract for Dr. Barry Martin for continued employment to extend to June 
30, 2017. 
 
ENCLOSURE  
None 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to approve administrative contract for Dr. Barry Martin as recommended for the 2014-
2015 through 2016-2017 school years. 

 
 

MOTION:     ___________     SUPPORT:    ____________    ACTION:    _____________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Vensel   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.4 
 
 

EXEMPT ADMINISTRATIVE CONTRACT EXTENSION 
 
 
BACKGROUND 
In order to provide notice of contract status, we are recommending that the board authorize 
administration to issue contracts for Julie Everly and Ryan McLeod for continued employment to 
extend to June 30, 2016. 
 
ENCLOSURE 
None 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to approve administrative contract extension for Julie Everly and Ryan McLeod as 
recommended for the 2015/16 school year. 

 
 

MOTION: _______________ SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.5 
 
 

EXEMPT ADMINISTRATIVE CONTRACT EXTENSION 
 
 
BACKGROUND 
In order to provide notice of contract status, we are recommending that the board authorize 
administration to issue contracts for Katherine Eighmey, Jerry Oley, and David Payne for 
continued employment to extend to June 30, 2015. 
 
ENCLOSURE 
None 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to approve administrative contract extension for Katherine Eighmey, Jerry Oley, and 
David Payne as recommended for the 2014/15 school year. 

 
 

MOTION: _______________ SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.6 
 
 

ADMINISTRATIVE CONTRACT EXTENSIONS 
 
 
BACKGROUND 
In order to provide notice of contract status, we are recommending that the board authorize 
administration to issue contracts for Montyne Barbee, Jennifer Bennett, Shelley Cormier, 
Matthew Cortez, Mary Ann Cyr, Kim Diven, William Ferrara, Cindy Flynn, Teresa Joseph, Lisa 
McLaughlin, Kelly McMahon, Steve Pollzzie, Melissa Provo, John Ray, and Otto Zillgitt, for 
employment to extend to June 30, 2015. 
 
Administrative placements for the 2014/15 school year will be presented to the Board of 
Education at a later date. 
 
ENCLOSURE 
None 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
Move to approve administrative contract extensions for: Montyne Barbee, Jennifer Bennett, 
Shelley Cormier, Matthew Cortez, Mary Ann Cyr, Kim Diven, William Ferrara, Cindy Flynn, 
Teresa Joseph, Lisa McLaughlin, Kelly McMahon, Steve Pollzzie, Melissa Provo, John Ray, and 
Otto Zillgitt as recommended for the 2014/15 school year. 

 
 

MOTION: _______________ SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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         Board Meeting #9 
         May 20, 2014 
         Item #C.7 
 

 
 

RESOLUTION TO SUPPORT THE MONROE COUNTY INTERMEDIATE 
SCHOOL DISTRICT PROPOSED BUDGET FOR 2014/15 

 
 
 
ENCLOSURE 
Resolution 
2014/2015 General Fund Budget Projection 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to approve the ISD Budget Resolution as presented. 
 
 
 
MOTION: _______________ SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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RESOLUTION 
 
 
 

 
WHEREAS,  Section 380.624 of the Revised School Code requires that the Monroe 
County Intermediate School Board present its proposed budget to each constituent district 
for review  by no later than May 1st; and,  
 
WHEREAS, not later than June 2nd , the Board of Education of each constituent school 
district shall review the proposed Monroe County Intermediate School District budget; 
and,  
 
WHEREAS, not later than June 2nd , the Board of Education of each constituent school 
district shall adopt a resolution expressing support for or disapproval of the proposed 
Monroe County  ISD budget and shall submit to the ISD board any specific objections 
and proposed changes it has to the proposed budget; and,  
 
THEREFORE, be it resolved, that the Board of Education of Monroe Public Schools 
adopts this resolution expressing its support of the Monroe County ISD proposed budget.  
 
 
Presented, approved and adopted this 20th day of May, 2014 
 
 
 
_______________________________  ______________________________ 
Barry N. Martin, Superintendent   Robert Yeo, President 
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         Board Meeting #9 
         May 20, 2014 
         Item #C.8 
 

 
SECTION 105 AND 105C OPT-OUT RESOLUTION 

 
 
BACKGROUND 
The State School Aid Act (MCL 380.1601 et seq) requires boards of education to take 
action each year to opt out of schools of choice, if they choose not to offer schools of 
choice or if they have a hybrid plan. Monroe County has its own Schools of Choice 
program; therefore, each district must opt out of §105 and 105c if they follow the Monroe 
County Program. 
 
ENCLOSURE 
Resolution 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to approve Section 105 and 105C Opt-out Resolution as presented. 
 
 
 
MOTION: _______________ SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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MONROE PUBLIC SCHOOLS DISTRICT 
 

 
Section 105 Opt-out Resolution 
 
WHEREAS, Section 105 of the State School Aid Act of 1979,  as amended by Public Act 297 of 

2000, permitted school districts to accept schools of choice enrollment applications from 
nonresident applicants residing within the same intermediate school district; and, 

 
WHEREAS,  by official action taken at its May 20, 2014 meeting, this Board of Education 

determined to not accept applications under §105 for enrollment from nonresident 
applicants residing within the same intermediate school district for the 2014-15 school 
year but instead will participate in the Monroe County School of Choice Program; and,  

 
WHEREAS, the District must comply with Section 105 of the State School Aid Act in order to 

avoid a state school aid penalty. 
 
Now therefore be it resolved that the School District will not accept applications under §105  

for  enrollment from nonresident applicants residing within the same intermediate school 
district for the 2014-15 school year but instead will participate in the Monroe County 
Schools of Choice Program.  

 
Section 105c Opt-Out Resolution:  
 
WHEREAS, Section 105c of the State School Aid Act of 1979, as amended by Public Act 297 

of 2000, permitted school districts to accept schools of choice enrollment applications by 
nonresident applicants residing in a district located in a contiguous intermediate school 
district; and, 

 
WHEREAS, by official action taken at its May 20, 2014  meeting, this Board of Education 

determined to  not accept applications under §105c for enrollment  by nonresident 
applicants residing in a district located in a contiguous intermediate school district for the 
2014-15  school year;  and,  

 
WHEREAS, the District must comply with the provisions of §105c of the State School Aid Act 

in order to avoid a state school aid penalty.  
 
Now therefore be it resolved that the School District will not accept applications  under §105c 

for  enrollment by nonresident applicants residing in a district located in a contiguous 
intermediate school district for the 2014-15 school year. 

 
 
 
 
__________________________________  ____________________________________ 
Robert Yeo, President     Lawrence VanWasshenova, Vice-President 
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__________________________________  ____________________________________ 
June Knabusch Taylor, Secretary   Dr. Tedd March, Parliamentarian 
 
 
 
__________________________________  ____________________________________ 
Aaron N. Mason, Trustee    Ryan Philbeck, Trustee 
 
 
 
__________________________________  ____________________________________ 
Wendy Spicer, Trustee    Barry N. Martin, Superintendent 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.9 
  
  

EMERGENCY ROOF REPAIR AT  
MONROE MIDDLE SCHOOL 

 

 

BACKGROUND 
See attached memo from Jerry Oley for details. 

 
ENCLOSURES 
Memo from Mr. Oley 
Bid from Nordman Roofing Co., Inc.  
Photos of damaged roof 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to accept the bid from Nordman Roofing Co., Inc. from Adrian, Michigan, for $12,474.00 
for emergency repair to the Monroe Middle School roof.  Money for this project will come from 
the Site Sinking Fund. 

 
 
MOTION:      SUPPORT:      ACTION:                    
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.10 
  
  

FIRST VEHICLE CONTRACT EXTENSION 
 

 

BACKGROUND 
See attached memo from Jerry Oley for details. 

 
ENCLOSURES 
Memo from Mr. Oley 
Letter from Karin Maurice, General Manager for First Vehicle Services  
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to accept the proposed one year contract extension from First Vehicle Services for the 
2014/2015 school year by adjusting the current contract price using Consumer Price Index (CPI).  

 
 
MOTION:      SUPPORT:      ACTION:                    
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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 Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.11 
  
  

CARPET AND TILE REPAIR AND REPLACEMENT  
 
 
BACKGROUND 
See attached memo from Jerry Oley for details. 

 
ENCLOSURES 
Memo from Mr. Oley 
Bids from Runyon’s Home Decorating, Morr-Kare Interiors, and Lakeside Interior  
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to accept the bid of $36,819.00 from Runyon’s Home Decorating of Monroe, Michigan, to 
repair and/or replace carpet throughout the district.  Money for this purchase will come from the 
Site Sinking Budget. 

 
 
MOTION:      SUPPORT:      ACTION:                    
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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                      May 16, 2014 
 
 
 
To:         Board of Education 
     Monroe Public Schools 

  
From:     Jerry Oley 
     Director of Operations  

  
Re:         District Carpet and Tile Replacement  
 
District carpet and tile replacement specifications were sent out for bid in late April. Nine 
(9) contractors received bid packets and three (3) bids were submitted. The bids were 
opened on Thursday, May 15, 2014. These bids have been reviewed and the lowest 
bidder is Runyon’s Home Decorating ($36,819.00). Their yardage count and square 
footage for tile were reviewed and their estimator is comfortable with his bid.   
  
It is my recommendation the low bidder, Runyon’s Home Decorating be awarded the 
2013 carpet and tile replacement project. As stated in the request for bids, Monroe 
Public Schools reserves the right to add or change installation locations if the change is 
in the best interest of the district.      
 
Runyon’s Home Decorating     $   36,819.00 
Monroe, MI  
 
Morr-Kare Interiors        $   49,015.63            
Erie, MI       
                         
Lakeside Interior                       $   61,582.00  
Perrysburg, OH 
 
Funds for carpet purchase will be taken from Building and Site Sinking Funds. 
 
If you need further information, please let me know. 
 
 
 
 
JAO/my 

NOTICE OF NONDISCRIMINATION 
  

It is the policy of Monroe Public Schools not to discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, gender, age, disability, religion, height, weight or marital status in 
its programs, services, employment, or any other activities.  For information contact the office of the Superintendent of Schools, 1275 N. Macomb St., Monroe, MI 

48162, 734-265-3010. 
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Contractor
Date 
Sent

Resent 
second 

time Bid Price 
Moor-Kare Interiors
918 East Erie Road 

Erie, MI  48133 emailed emailed $49,015.63
dshook5@charter.net 4/9/2014 4/29/2014
734-777-1091 - Dan Shook
Runyon's Home Decorating
1975 N. Monroe Street faxed faxed 

Monroe, MI  48162 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 $36,819.00
734-242-2836
734-242-8320 - Fax 
Sherwin-Williams Co.
3032 South Avenue, Unit F emailed emailed 

Toledo, OH  43609 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 No Bid 
swrep4167@sherwin.com
419-309-2108 - Mike
Finishers Unlimited of Monroe 
757 South Telegraph faxed faxed 

Monroe, MI  48162 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 No Bid 
734-243-3502
734-243-4328 - Fax
Imperial Floor Covering
2550 E. Oakwood Park, Suite 200 emailed emailed 

Walled Lake, MI 48390 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 No Bid 
imperial200@comcast.net
248-669-3737 (Ernie)
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Contractor
Date 
Sent Resent Bid Price 

Lakeside Interior Contractors Inc.
26970 Eckel Road

Perrysburg, OH 43551 emailed emailed $61,582.00
rfrazier@lakesideinterior.com 4/9/2014 4/29/2014
419-867-1300 - Randy
Tri State Floors
1302 S. Expressway Dr. faxed faxed 

Toledo, OH  43608 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 No Bid 
419-727-4900
Fax:  419-727-3922  Attn:  Josh Schultt
Shock Brothers
20320 Cornillie Dr.

charles@shockbrothers.com emailed emailed 

Roseville, Mi. 48066 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 No Bid 
586-585-7470
Carpet Spectrum

chuck@ilovemyfloor.com emailed emailed 

1855 S Reynolds Rd. 4/9/2014 4/29/2014 No Bid 
Toledo, Ohio 43614
419-467-4748
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         Board Meeting #9 
         May 20, 2014 
         Item #C.12 
 
 

MHS VARSITY TRACK AND FIELD 
MHSAA STATE FINALS 

 
 
BACKGROUND 
John Ray, Monroe High School Athletic Director, wishes to petition the Board of Education 
for approval for the MHS Varsity Track and Field team to travel to Rockford, Michigan in 
order to participate in the MHSAA State Finals. The competition will take place at Rockford 
High School on Saturday, May 31, 2014. The students will be transported in private vehicles 
with all the proper documentation finished before departure.  The group will be staying one 
night in Grand Rapids, Michigan, at the Howard Johnson Plaza Hotel. Once the finals are 
completed the group will travel home. The Monroe Public Schools Athletic fund will be used 
to cover the cost of this trip and all aspects of the trip will be in accordance with related 
Board policies.   
 
ENCLOSURES 
Monroe Public Schools – Abbreviated Field Trip and Excursion Check List Form.  The 
complete packet is housed in the office of the Assistant Superintendent of Elementary 
Education, Instruction and Human Resources.  
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to approve the attendance of Monroe High School students at the MHSAA Varsity 
Track and Field State Meet in Rockford, Michigan, according to the terms of Policy 
IICA, Field Trips and Excursions. 
 
MOTION: _______________ SUPPORT: _________________   ACTION: ________ 
 
    Aye  Nay  Abstain Absent 
 
Mrs. Knabusch-Taylor ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Dr. March   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Mason   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Philbeck   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Ms. Spicer   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. VanWasshenova  ____  ____  ____  ____ 
Mr. Yeo   ____  ____  ____  ____ 
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                                                                                                        Board Meeting #9 
 May 20, 2014 
 Item #C.17 
 
 
 
        
 

ADJOURNMENT 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION 
Move to adjourn the May 20, 2014 Board Meeting #9. 
 
 
HAND VOTE 
 
 
 
MOTION:                           SUPPORT:                           ACTION:               
 
 
    TIME:     
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